
 INCIDENT REPORTS FOR 2023 

 

January 2, pre-dawn -- Incident #1 -- medical call in Filing 7 -- CLVFD 
emergency responders provided patient assessment and care while Special Duty 
Responders led in the Red Feather Lakes ambulance and firefighters stood by to 
assist as necessary.  
   
January 6, noon -- Incident #2 -- smoke report near Beaver Meadows -- CLVFD 
firefighters and Special Duty Responders turned out to find the source of smoke 
sighted south of Beaver Meadows. It was tracked to a forest service pile burn and 
all responders stood down. 
 
January 30, evening -- Incident #3 -- medical call near 73C and 67J -- CLVFD 
emergency responders joined Red Feather Lakes emergency responders in 
providing patient assessment and care while firefighters stood by to assist as 
necessary. 
 
February 5, evening -- Incident #4 -- mutual aid to GVMVFD -- CLVFD 
firefighters responded to assist Glacier View Meadows VFD with a vehicle fire 
threatening to become a wildland fire. GVMVFD responders got the fire under 
control before CLVFD responders arrived on scene and stood all non-GVMVFD 
responders down at that time. 
 
February 16, morning -- Incident #5 -- medical call at fire station -- CLVFD 
emergency responders provided patient assessment and care while Special Duty 
Responders led in the Red Feather Lakes ambulance and firefighters stood by to 
assist as necessary.  
 
February 20, morning -- Incident #6 -- powerlines down in Filing 5 -- CLVFD 
firefighters and Special Duty Responders turned out in response to reports of 
powerlines down in high winds. The lines were determined to no longer be 
energized and thus not a fire hazard, but responders remained on scene, 
controlling traffic around the area, until PVREA arrived to repair the lines.   
 
February 22 & 23 -- Incident #7 -- Slash Depot burn -- CLVFD firefighters and 
Special Duty Responders worked with a Larimer County burn boss and RFLVFD 
to safely burn the Slash Depot piles and manned the burn for the first thirty-six 
hours, until the fire activity had subsided enough that they could safely be 
monitored periodically instead of continuously. 
 
February 25, afternoon -- Incident #8 -- medical call at Beaver Meadows -- 
CLVFD emergency responders provided patient assessment and care while 



Special Duty Responders led in the Red Feather Lakes and UC Health 
ambulances and firefighters established a landing zone for the Lifeline helicopter. 
 
March 24, afternoon -- Incident #9 -- medical call at Beaver Meadows -- CLVFD 
emergency responders provided patient assessment and care while Special Duty 
Responders led in the Red Feather Lakes and UC Health ambulances.  
   
March 28, afternoon -- Incident #10 -- medical call in Filing 7 -- CLVFD 
emergency responders provided patient assessment and care while Special Duty 
Responders led in the Red Feather Lakes and UC Health ambulances.  
   
March 31, evening -- Incident #11 -- fire call at the Slash Depot -- CLVFD 
firefighters responded when high winds rekindled embers from the slash burn 
ashes and joined RFLVFD firefighters in thoroughly wetting down and stirring up 
the ash piles until there were no remaining hot spots.  
 
April 11, morning -- Incident #12 -- medical call in Filing 8 -- CLVFD emergency 
responders provided patient assessment and care while Special Duty Responders 
led in the Red Feather Lakes and UC Health ambulances.   
 
April 22, morning -- Incident #13 -- mutual aid to Red Feather -- CLVFD 
firefighters responded to assist Red Feather VFD with a fire in the 
attic of the Red Feather Tavern. Glacier View VFD also responded to 
assist, and between the three departments, the fire was quickly 
extinguished. 
 
May 22, morning -- Incident #14 -- wildland fire in Filing 14 -- CLVFD 
firefighters responded to a small wildland fire caused by the improper disposal of 
ashes. Thankfully, the owner of the neighboring property noticed the smoke and 
reported it quickly, and the fire was extinguished before it could spread beyond 
the property of origin. 
  
May 23, afternoon -- Incident #15 -- medical call in Elkridge -- CLVFD 
emergency responders provided patient assessment and care while Special Duty 
Responders led in the Red Feather Lakes and UC Health ambulances.   
  
May 25, night -- Incident #16 -- medical call in Filing 6 -- CLVFD emergency 
responders provided patient assessment and care while Special Duty Responders 
led in the Red Feather Lakes and UC Health ambulances.  
 
June 1, afternoon -- Incident #17 -- smoke report on South Ottawa -- CLVFD 
firefighters responded to reports of smoke sighted from the north side of the lake 
looking south. After some effort, firefighters were able to trace this to a property 



owner using their approved firepit in a safe manner -- due to wet weather, the 
wood was damp and putting up more smoke than usual. 
  
June 3, morning -- Incident #18 -- medical call in Filing 4 -- CLVFD emergency 
responders provided patient assessment and care while Special Duty Responders 
led in the Red Feather Lakes ambulance and firefighters stood by in case they 
were needed to establish a landing zone for Lifeline. 
 
June 6, morning -- Incident #19 -- medical call in Elkridge -- CLVFD emergency 
responders provided patient assessment and care while firefighters set up a 
landing zone for the Lifeline helicopter. Special Duty Responders set up traffic 
control around the landing zone and led in the Red Feather Lakes and UC Health 
ambulances. 
  
June 10, afternoon -- Incident #20 -- smoke report in the 14th Filing -- CLVFD 
and RFLVFD firefighters responded to reports of smoke sighted from the village. 
After some effort, firefighters were able to trace this to a property owner in the 
14th filing who was burning slash. Slash burns are not permitted by the 
association at all, nor by the county at this time of year, and the manner of 
burning would have been unsafe at any time. Please dispose of your slash 
responsibly. 
 
June 21, evening -- Incident #21 -- smoke alarm in Pearl Creek -- CLVFD 
firefighters responded to a smoke alarm sounding in a vacant residence. 
Firefighters were able to determine that there was no fire and the alarm was 
malfunctioning and stood down. 
  
June 22, pre-dawn -- Incident #22 -- medical call in Filing 5 -- CLVFD emergency 
responders provided patient assessment and care while firefighters set up a 
landing zone for the Lifeline helicopter. Special Duty Responders set up traffic 
control around the landing zone and led in the Red Feather Lakes and UC Health 
ambulances. 
  
June 24, morning -- Incident #23 -- medical call in Filing 12 -- CLVFD emergency 
responders provided patient assessment and care while firefighters set up a 
landing zone for the Lifeline helicopter. Special Duty Responders set up traffic 
control around the landing zone and led in the Red Feather Lakes and UC Health 
ambulances. 
  
June 22, pre-dawn -- Incident #24 -- medical call in Filing 5 -- CLVFD emergency 
responders provided patient assessment and care with firefighters assisting as 
needed while Special Duty Responders led in the Red Feather Lakes and UC 
Health ambulances. 



June 29, afternoon -- Incident #25 -- medical call in Filing 11 -- CLVFD 
emergency responders provided patient assessment and care with firefighters 
assisting as needed while Special Duty Responders led in the UC Health 
ambulance. 
  
July 4, afternoon -- Incident #27 (Dispatch accidentally skipped #26) -- medical 
call in Filing 11 -- CLVFD emergency responders provided patient assessment and 
care and firefighters set up a landing zone for Lifeline (which was ultimately not 
needed) while Special Duty Responders set up traffic control around the landing 
zone and led in the Red Feather Lakes ambulance. 
  
July 8, afternoon -- Incident #28 -- medical call in Filing 11 -- CLVFD emergency 
responders provided patient assessment and care for someone who came to the 
fire station while department members were there cleaning up from training. No 
transport was requested or required. 
  
July 10, afternoon -- Incident #29 -- medical call in Filing 6 -- CLVFD firefighters 
and Special Duty Responders turned out in response to a request for medical 
assistance but were stood down before reaching the scene.  
  
July 13, evening -- Incident #30 -- medical call in Filing 11 -- CLVFD emergency 
responders provided patient assessment and care while firefighters set up a 
landing zone for the Lifeline helicopter. Special Duty Responders set up traffic 
control around the landing zone and led in the Red Feather Lakes ambulance. 
 
July 20, morning -- Incident #31 -- MVA in Filing 12 -- CLVFD firefighters 
responded to stabilize a vehicle that had gone partway off the road where there 
was a drop-off and was balanced precariously, the occupants unable to safely get 
out. Firefighters secured the vehicle and helped the occupants out; then medical 
responders checked that they were physically okay. Special Duty Responders set 
up traffic control around the incident and firefighters remained until it could be 
safely extricated. 
  
July 25, night -- Incident #32 -- medical call in Filing 2 -- CLVFD emergency 
responders provided patient assessment and care while firefighters set up a 
landing zone for the Lifeline helicopter. Special Duty Responders set up traffic 
control around the landing zone and led in the Red Feather Lakes and UC Health 
ambulances. 
 
August 1, night -- Incident #33 -- medical call in Filing 9 -- CLVFD emergency 
responders provided patient assessment and care while firefighters set up a 
landing zone for the Lifeline helicopter. Special Duty Responders set up traffic 



control around the landing zone and led in the Red Feather Lakes and UC Health 
ambulances. 
  
August 2, afternoon -- Incident #34 -- welfare call in Filing 13 -- CLVFD 
personnel responded to search for a confused person who'd wandered away from 
their residence. Responders were able to locate the person quickly and return 
them to safety. 
  
August 4, afternoon -- Incident #35 -- mutual aid to RFLVFD -- CLVFD 
firefighters responded to assist Red Feather Lakes VFD firefighters with a 
wildfire reported in the vicinity of Lady Moon Trail. This smoldering fire was 
determined to be in the prescribed burn area, the forest service was notified 
about the flareup, and all responders stood down. 
  
August 5, afternoon -- Incident #36 -- mutual aid to RFLVFD -- CLVFD 
firefighters responded to assist Red Feather Lakes VFD firefighters in rescuing a 
large dog that had gotten into a place on a rock outcropping that it could not get 
back down from. Responders climbed up to where the dog was and used a ladder 
and some pieces of plywood to create a bridge for him to get back down. 
  
August 6, evening -- Incident #37 -- medical call in Filing 13 -- CLVFD emergency 
responders provided patient assessment and care while firefighters stood by in 
case a landing zone was needed for the Lifeline helicopter and Special Duty 
Responders staged to lead in the Red Feather Lakes ambulance. After medical 
providers were on scene, further assistance was refused and all responders stood 
down. 
  
August 7, pre-dawn -- Incident #38 -- medical call in Filing 13 -- CLVFD 
emergency responders provided patient assessment and care while firefighters 
set up a landing zone for the Lifeline helicopter. Special Duty Responders set up 
traffic control around the landing zone and led in the Red Feather Lakes and UC 
Health ambulances. 
  
August 12, afternoon -- Incident #39 -- smoke report southwest of Crystal Lakes -
- CLVFD responders turned out in response to reports of smoke sighted 
southwest of Panhandle Reservoir. The smoke was tracked to a campfire on a 
property in the Pearl Creek area and after verifying that it was being safely 
conducted, all responders stood down. 
 
August 14, morning -- Incident #40 -- slash burn in Pearl Creek -- CLVFD 
firefighters responded to an illegal slash burn in the Pearl Creek area. Responders 
doused the fire, reported the incident to the sheriff's department, and stood 
down. 



  
August 19, evening -- Incident #41 -- mutual aid to RFLVFD -- CLVFD was paged 
out to assist Red Feather Lakes VFD in responding to a medical call in the 
Cherokee Park area. This was determined to be closer to Livermore VFD's district 
and they were called out to assist while CLVFD stood down. 
 
August 27, evening -- Incident #42 -- medical call in Filing 11 -- CLVFD 
emergency responders provided patient assessment and care while firefighters 
stood by in case a landing zone was needed for the Lifeline helicopter and Special 
Duty Responders staged to lead in the Red Feather Lakes ambulance. After 
medical providers were on scene, further assistance was refused and all 
responders stood down. 
  
August 31, morning -- Incident #43 -- medical call in Filing 1 -- CLVFD 
emergency responders provided patient assessment and care while firefighters 
stood by in case a landing zone was needed for the Lifeline helicopter and Special 
Duty Responders staged to lead in the Red Feather Lakes ambulance.  
  
 
 
 
 


